
 

GOVERNMENT OF ANDHRA PRADESH 

A B S T R A C T 
 

Women Dev. Child Welfare & Disabled Welfare Department – Availment of any number of 
different concessions given for meeting   different needs to differently abled persons – 
Orders – Issued.  
===========================================================  

WOMEN DEV.CHILD WELFARE & DISABLED WELFARE (DW.A1) DEPT. 

 

G.O.Ms.No.19                                                                                      Dt.25-6-2008 

                                                                                                              Read:- 

 

               From the Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled and  

               Senior Citizens, Hyd. Lr.No.S.X/Genl/2007, dt.15-5-2008. 

 

                                                             *** 

O R D E R:- 
 

                    In the reference read above, the Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled 
and Senior Citizens, Hyderabad has informed that representations have been received from 
differently abled persons stating that the Field Officers of various departments are not 
sanctioning more than one benefit to them and they have requested to allow all the benefits 
irrespective of the nature of benefit.   
 
 2.              Further, she has requested to issue instructions to all the District Collectors for 
sanction of various benefits irrespective of the nature of the benefit to differently abled persons 
as each of the benefit gives a different nature of support or rehabilitation to them 
 
3.           The benefits like Pensions, Scholarships, Indira Avaas Yojana (IAY) Houses, and 
Economic Support Schemes etc.  are independent of each other and confer or provide  different 
nature of support for  differently abled.. 
 



4.             After careful examination of the proposal and in the circumstances reported by the 
Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled and Senior Citizens in the reference read 
above, Government hereby issue orders for sanction of various benefits like Pensions, 
Scholarships, IAY Houses, Economic Support Scheme etc. to the eligible persons as per 
eligibility criteria and conditions stipulated for each scheme/benefit, irrespective of the nature of 
the benefit, to differently abled persons, provided  each of the benefit gives a different nature of  
support or rehabilitative support to them. However, it shall be ensured that benefits reach 
deserving eligible persons in an equitous manner and computerized monitoring introduced by 
Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled and Senior Citizens and Managing Director, 
A.P.Vikalangula Co-operative Corporation at the earliest. 
 

5.              This order does not require the concurrence of Finance Department as per the rules 
in force. 
 
 6.           The Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled and Senior Citizens, Hyderabad 
is requested to take necessary action accordingly. 
 

(BY ORDER AND IN THE NAME OF THE GOVRNOR OF ANDHRA PRADESH) 

 

                                                                                                   M.CHAYA RATAN 

Prl. Secretary to Government 

To 

The Commissioner, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled and Senior Citizens, Hyderabad. 

All the District Collectors in the State 

All the Assistant Directors, Dept. for the Welfare of Disabled  

      and Senior Citizens in the State 

Copy to:: 

P.S. to Prl.Secretary to C.M. 

P.S. to Chief Secretary 

OSD to M(WDCW&DW) 

S.F./S.Cs 

//FORWARDED BY ORDER// 

 

SECTION OFFICER 


